
Duplex te koop in Benahavís, Benahavís 590.000 - 3.750 €
Referentie: R4861249  Slaapkamers: 5  Badkamers: 3  Perceelgrootte: 235m  Terras: 15m2 2
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Costa del Sol, Benahavís

Welcome to your new home in the heart of Benahavís! 

This exclusive and modern 235 m² duplex has been completely renovated with the highest quality materials, combining
elegance, comfort and an exceptional layout. 

Located in the heart of Benahavís, one of the most charming towns on the Costa del Sol, this property stands out for its
spaciousness, luminosity and a design designed to offer you maximum comfort in each of its spaces. 

When you enter the apartment on the upper floor, you will be surprised by the spacious living-dining room, an open
and welcoming space that becomes the epicentre of the home. Here you will find a fireplace that provides warmth and
a touch of tradi=onal style, ideal for crea=ng a unique atmosphere during the colder months. From the living room, you
will have direct access to a large terrace where you can enjoy the vibrant atmosphere of the town of Benahavis. This
space is perfect for relaxing outdoors, enjoying a family meal or simply contempla=ng the natural landscape that
surrounds the town. 

The kitchen, fully equipped with top quality appliances, has a prac=cal indoor and outdoor laundry room, ideal for
op=mising the use of space. On this same floor, you also have a comfortable and bright bedroom, along with a full
bathroom, perfect for visitors. 

Going down an elegant staircase, you will reach the lower floor, where there are three large double bedrooms. The
main one stands out for having an en-suite bathroom, designed with impeccable taste and luxury materials. The other
two bedrooms share a full bathroom, both designed to offer maximum comfort. On this floor you will also discover a
mul=purpose space, ideal for conver=ng it into an office, a study, a games room or a fiDh bedroom, depending on your
needs. 

Every corner of this duplex has been carefully cared for: the furniture is completely new, so everything is ready for you
to seFle in without any worries other than enjoying yourself. The renova=on has been carried out under strict quality
standards, guaranteeing a modern and high-end atmosphere in all rooms. 

In addi=on to all these ameni=es, the apartment has a separate entrance, giving it excep=onal privacy and a feeling of a
secluded home within the vibrant center of Benahavís. You will be just a few steps from restaurants, shops and all the
services that this picturesque town has to offer, while being able to enjoy the tranquility of an exclusive residen=al
environment. 

This is the ideal home for those looking for space, style and a privileged loca=on. Don&apos;t miss this opportunity and
come and see it!
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Kenmerken:
Extra's 
Nabij transport 
Privéterras 
Gemonteerde kasten 
Houten vloeren 

Zonorientatie 
Oosten 
Zuidoost 

Klimaatbeheersing 
Airconditioning 
Haard 

Uitzicht 
Berg 
Stedelijk 
Woud 

Ligging 
Commercieel gebied 
Dicht bij golf 
Dicht bij winkels 
Dicht bij de stad 
Dicht bij scholen 
Dorp 

Huidige Staat 
Uitstekend 
Onlangs gerenoveerd 
Onlangs gerenoveerd 

Meubilering 
Volledig ingericht 

Keuken 
Volledig passend 

Beveiliging 
Alarmsysteem 

Parkeergelegenheid 
Straat 

Voorzieningen 
Elektriciteit 
Drinkbaar water 

Categorie 
Investering 
Luxe 
Modern 
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